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Euthanized the dog is what they were told by a couple of trainers One being a police K9 handler and
dog trainer, shamefully And the other one being a behaviorist, possibly a weekend qualified one Killing
this beautiful Australian shepherd was never a thought process in our minds She was reactive towards
every person and dog, pulling on the leash, nosing the ground, zero engagement, so not a good
combination So we start off with loose leash walking, control and engagement, so we can effectively
communicate And then we add a formal heel, which the dog's not allowed to break until released We
also instill a disengagement command we could use towards any dogs or people if she decides to react
And then we bring dog and person into the mix, double trouble She would react from hundreds of
meters out We do create a bit of space just to make it easy for her and then incrementally getting closer
and closer She's doing really well She even gets to a stage where she's able to look at the owner after
looking at the dog and person. ■: Great work as always ■ Princessbri: Wow!!! Amazing! Beautiful dog



#Hatefield: Well trained dogs seem so much happier! jaclyn: Please make a youtube channel!
Alexandra Duma ■♥■: Amazing! ■ You_Dont_Know_Me: My question is….when beginning the basics
with the heel, do you correct every time they try to sniff the ground? Or stop paying attention to you? ■:
Do you have any more detailed videos on YouTube? Would love a more in depth view. Good work!
Rosemarie Booth: amazing CERBERUS BULLIES: there is no shame in BE for dogs that have no hope
after all avenues have been exhausted. The owners need to follow thru with you often to stick ■ Angel
The Siberian Husky ■: Beautiful■I love letting people know a “professional” told me Huskys don’t listen
and dogs don’t walk backwards. I put him to shame within the hour.
https://www.tiktok.com/@bigdogfellas/video/7300303244260035872 How can I stop my dog being
reactive? 1. Identify the trigger: Figure out what specific situations or stimuli cause your dog to react.
This could be other dogs, strangers, loud noises, etc. 2. Counter-conditioning and desensitization:
Gradually expose your dog to the trigger in a controlled and positive way, while rewarding them for
calm behavior. This will help change their association with the trigger from negative to positive. 3.
Training and obedience: Work on basic obedience commands with your dog, such as sit, stay, and
come. This can help redirect their focus and maintain control in potentially reactive situations. 4. Use
positive reinforcement: Reward your dog with treats, praise, or toys when they exhibit calm behavior in
high-stress situations. This will help reinforce the desired behavior and encourage them to remain calm
in the future. 5. Seek professional help: If your dog's reactivity is severe or persistent, consider working
with a professional dog trainer or behaviorist to help address the issue. They can provide guidance and
a customized training plan to help your dog overcome their reactive behavior. 6. Maintain a calm
environment: Dogs can often pick up on their owner's emotions, so staying calm and relaxed in
stressful situations can help prevent your dog from becoming reactive. Avoid getting anxious or tense,
as this can escalate your dog's reactivity. 7. Exercise and mental stimulation: Ensure your dog is getting
enough physical exercise and mental stimulation to prevent boredom and pent-up energy, which can
contribute to reactive behavior. Regular walks, playtime, and interactive toys can help keep your dog
happy and well-balanced. How do you calm down a reactive dog? 1. Remove the trigger: If your dog is
reacting aggressively to a specific trigger, such as another dog or a loud noise, try to remove your dog
from the situation or remove the trigger itself. 2. Stay calm: Dogs can pick up on their owner's emotions,
so it is important to remain calm and composed when trying to calm down a reactive dog. 3. Use
positive reinforcement: Use treats or toys to redirect your dog's attention away from the trigger and
towards something positive. 4. Implement training exercises: Work on training exercises with your dog
to help them learn to control their reactions and behave more appropriately in stressful situations. 5.
Seek professional help: If your dog's reactivity is severe or if you are unable to calm them down on your
own, consider seeking help from a professional dog trainer or behaviorist. They can provide additional
guidance and support in managing your dog's reactivity. Can a dog reactive dog be cured? While a dog
reactive dog may not be cured completely, their reactivity can be managed and improved through
training, behavior modification, and desensitization exercises. It is important for the dog owner to work
with a professional trainer or behaviorist who has experience with reactive dogs to develop a
comprehensive plan to address the behavior. Consistent training and positive reinforcement can help
the dog learn to be calmer and more relaxed in situations that trigger their reactivity. It is essential to be
patient and understanding of the dog's behavior and progress. What not to do with a reactive dog? 1.
Don't punish or scold the dog for reactive behavior. This can cause more stress and exacerbate the
issue. 2. Don't force interactions with other dogs or people if the dog is uncomfortable or reactive. This
can make the problem worse and put both the dog and others at risk of harm. 3. Don't use aversive
training methods or tools, such as shock collars or prong collars, as they can increase fear and
aggression in reactive dogs. 4. Don't ignore signs of stress or anxiety in your dog. It's important to
address and manage these emotions before they escalate into reactive behavior. 5. Don't overwhelm
the dog with too many stimuli or triggers at once. Gradually desensitize and countercondition the dog to
their triggers in a controlled and safe environment. 6. Don't avoid seeking professional help if you are
struggling to manage your dog's reactive behavior. A certified trainer or behaviorist can provide
guidance and support to help you and your dog.


